FURNITURE-BIG ITEMS: Quotes must be emailed to cclevenger@dcmcpartners.com by October 7th 12:00 PM CST

_ . School Speciali . Lake Charles 5
Item Item Description Item Specs Item Quantity Vender 1 Vendor 2 Vendor 3 Vendor 4 Amazon p ty School Outfitters Office Depot GBP Direct Comments
multi items Offices Supply
i i School Specialty, Vendors contacted today for quotes.
Adjustable Height . X y g B
$230.71 each. All in X . School Outfitters, La. Office Furniture,
. . Steel AV Cart Office Depot Bid K K !
Projector Carts Adjustable steel cart 42 stock at the Wayfair,Bush Furniture, Cymax,Cleanit
24x18x24 to 42 uploaded 10/5/20 .
Inches moment. Quote Supply Company. | have logged in the
given by information that | received so far.
Cymax (Kaveesh.K@cymax.com)866- X 3
" eric@cleanitsupply.
72"W x 40"H 740-9830 NO bid 3 )
Double-Sided com. Eric_advised
White Board Rolling White Board ou e_, ‘e 42 that all of these are
Magnetic R
- in stock at the
Whiteboard moment. (484-685- Louisian Office Suooly N .
Rolling book shelf Need spec 42 5407 otflsmna |c? upply No Quote due
to time constraint.
Hamilton Buhl Still have not X .
: f " . . . Office Depot Bid
Projector screens Screen for projector 80X80" projector 42 Cymax No bid received a quote
. uploaded 10/5/20
screen back on this item.
Kaveesh.K@cymax.com$549.99 Hirsh
) ) ) [50"Hx18"Wx18"D brand bid in putty color. Have 29 in Still have not Office Depot Bid
Podium Single Person Standing Podiy R 36 stock at the moment. Unsure when received a quote
Podium — . uploaded 10/5/20
the additional ones would be back on this item.
available. They do not assemble.
66"W x 78"D L-
station includes two Still have not Office Depot Bid
. . p
Secretary desk L shaped desk box drawers for 6 No bid received a quote
X . . uploaded 10/5/20
office supplies and back on this item.
three file drawers
School Outfitters $379.99 however;
this does not include shipping and
you will need to provide a tax
exemption form if tax is not charged. N
29"H x 71"W x 70 The order will need to be placed by Still have not Office Depot Bid
Office Desks U-Shaped Office Desk 4 received a quote
5/6"D U shape desk Monday at noon however; the .q' uploaded 10/5/20
X X . back on this item.
shipment if the order is placed by
noon Monday is not due to arrive
until Oct. 12th. Assembly is not
included in this price.
- Still have not ) .
. _ . . . D
Teacher desk Single Sitting Office Desk 30"X60" double 49 No bid received a quote Office Depot Bid
pedastal desk . uploaded 10/5/20
back on this item.
44.5"H x 25.75"W x Still have not X .
. . . . . X R Office Depot Bid
Teacher chair High back ergonomic chair [30.13"D ergonomic 57 No bid received a quote
. . uploaded 10/5/20
chair back on this item.
60"WX24"D Still have not X .
3 ) R Office Depot Bid
Classroom Table 60w x 24d foldable table w/\|foldable table with 110 No bid received a quote
. uploaded 10/5/20
wheels back on this item.
School Outfitters $96.07 however;
this does not include shipping and
you will need to provide a tax
exemption form if tax is not charged.
33.5"H x 16"W x The order will need to be placed by Still have not Office Depot Bid
. . N . p
student chairs stackable 18 in. 21"D Stackable 157 Monday at noon however; the received a quote
. . . . L uploaded 10/5/20
chairs shipment if the order is placed by back on this item.
noon Monday is not due to arrive
until Oct. 12th. Assembly is not
included in this price. Quoted on a
black chair.
Filing cabinet 2 drawer filing cabinet Two drawer letter 7 Cymax $389.99 delivered but not Office Depot Bid

size file cabinet

assembled. 87 in stock at this time.

uploaded 10/5/20



https://www.schoolspecialty.com/ProductDisplay?top_category5=&top_category4=&top_category3=&urlRequestType=Base&productId=3074457345616822664&catalogId=10101&top_category2=&categoryId=&errorViewName=ProductDisplayErrorView&urlLangId=-1&langId=-1&top_category=&parent_category_rn=&storeId=10801
https://www.luxorfurn.com/72-w-x-40-h-double-sided-magnetic-whiteboard.html
mailto:Cymax%20(Kaveesh.K@cymax.com)866-740-9830%20%20NO%20bid
mailto:School%20Specialty,%20$230.71%20each.%20All%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20Quote%20given%20by%20eric@cleanitsupply.com.%20Eric%20%20advised%20that%20all%20of%20these%20are%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20(484-685-5407)
mailto:Cymax%20(Kaveesh.K@cymax.com)866-740-9830%20%20NO%20bid
mailto:School%20Specialty,%20$230.71%20each.%20All%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20Quote%20given%20by%20eric@cleanitsupply.com.%20Eric%20%20advised%20that%20all%20of%20these%20are%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20(484-685-5407)
https://www.adorama.com/hbwsw80.html
https://www.cymax.com/Hirsh-Mobile-Locking-Podium-for-Classroom-or-Office-in-Arctic-Silver-and-Gray-24077.htm
mailto:Kaveesh.K@cymax.com$549.99%20Hirsh%20brand%20bid%20in%20putty%20color.%20%20Have%2029%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20Unsure%20when%20the%20additional%20ones%20would%20be%20available.%20%20They%20do%20not%20assemble
mailto:Kaveesh.K@cymax.com$549.99%20Hirsh%20brand%20bid%20in%20putty%20color.%20%20Have%2029%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20Unsure%20when%20the%20additional%20ones%20would%20be%20available.%20%20They%20do%20not%20assemble
mailto:Kaveesh.K@cymax.com$549.99%20Hirsh%20brand%20bid%20in%20putty%20color.%20%20Have%2029%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20Unsure%20when%20the%20additional%20ones%20would%20be%20available.%20%20They%20do%20not%20assemble
mailto:Kaveesh.K@cymax.com$549.99%20Hirsh%20brand%20bid%20in%20putty%20color.%20%20Have%2029%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20Unsure%20when%20the%20additional%20ones%20would%20be%20available.%20%20They%20do%20not%20assemble
mailto:Kaveesh.K@cymax.com$549.99%20Hirsh%20brand%20bid%20in%20putty%20color.%20%20Have%2029%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20Unsure%20when%20the%20additional%20ones%20would%20be%20available.%20%20They%20do%20not%20assemble
https://www.hon.com/desks/foundation/hlmlpp6678pinc
https://www.staples.com/Bush-Furniture-Somerset-60W-L-Shaped-Desk-with-Hutch-Hansen-Cherry-SET002HC/product_147588
https://www.cymax.com/Hirsh-Mobile-Teacher-s-Desk-30-x60-Double-Pedestal-Black-Walnut-22658.htm
https://www.cymax.com/ESSENTIALS-HI-BACK-MESH-CHAIR-SWIVEL-TILT-CNL-ESS-3050.htm
https://www.cymax.com/Bush-Business-Furniture-60W-x-24D-Folding-Training-Table-with-Wheels-FTW160SGK.htm
https://www.cymax.com/Andy-18-Stack-Chair-Navy-Blue-4540NV.htm
mailto:Cymax%20(Kaveesh.K@cymax.com)866-740-9830%20%20NO%20bid
mailto:Cymax%20(Kaveesh.K@cymax.com)866-740-9830%20%20NO%20bid
mailto:School%20Specialty,%20$230.71%20each.%20All%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20Quote%20given%20by%20eric@cleanitsupply.com.%20Eric%20%20advised%20that%20all%20of%20these%20are%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20(484-685-5407)
mailto:School%20Specialty,%20$230.71%20each.%20All%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20Quote%20given%20by%20eric@cleanitsupply.com.%20Eric%20%20advised%20that%20all%20of%20these%20are%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20(484-685-5407)
mailto:School%20Specialty,%20$230.71%20each.%20All%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20Quote%20given%20by%20eric@cleanitsupply.com.%20Eric%20%20advised%20that%20all%20of%20these%20are%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20(484-685-5407)
mailto:School%20Specialty,%20$230.71%20each.%20All%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20Quote%20given%20by%20eric@cleanitsupply.com.%20Eric%20%20advised%20that%20all%20of%20these%20are%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20(484-685-5407)
mailto:School%20Specialty,%20$230.71%20each.%20All%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20Quote%20given%20by%20eric@cleanitsupply.com.%20Eric%20%20advised%20that%20all%20of%20these%20are%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20(484-685-5407)
mailto:School%20Specialty,%20$230.71%20each.%20All%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20Quote%20given%20by%20eric@cleanitsupply.com.%20Eric%20%20advised%20that%20all%20of%20these%20are%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20(484-685-5407)
mailto:School%20Specialty,%20$230.71%20each.%20All%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20Quote%20given%20by%20eric@cleanitsupply.com.%20Eric%20%20advised%20that%20all%20of%20these%20are%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20(484-685-5407)
mailto:School%20Specialty,%20$230.71%20each.%20All%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20Quote%20given%20by%20eric@cleanitsupply.com.%20Eric%20%20advised%20that%20all%20of%20these%20are%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20(484-685-5407)
mailto:School%20Specialty,%20$230.71%20each.%20All%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20Quote%20given%20by%20eric@cleanitsupply.com.%20Eric%20%20advised%20that%20all%20of%20these%20are%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20(484-685-5407)
mailto:School%20Specialty,%20$230.71%20each.%20All%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20Quote%20given%20by%20eric@cleanitsupply.com.%20Eric%20%20advised%20that%20all%20of%20these%20are%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20(484-685-5407)
mailto:School%20Specialty,%20$230.71%20each.%20All%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20Quote%20given%20by%20eric@cleanitsupply.com.%20Eric%20%20advised%20that%20all%20of%20these%20are%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20(484-685-5407)

FURNITURE-BIG ITEMS: Quotes must be emailed to cclevenger@dcmcpartners.com by October 7th 12:00 PM CST

. . School Speciali 5 Lake Charl .
Item Item Description Item Specs Item Quantity Vender 1 Vendor 2 Vendor 3 Vendor 4 Amazon p ty School Outfitters Office Depot ke Eharies GBP Direct Comments
multi items Offices Supply
52"H x 15.15"W x . . X .
Filing cabinet 4 drawer verticle, lockable [25"D letter size file 63 Cymax $72, 99, delivered. 119in Office Depot Bid
. R stock at this time. uploaded 10/5/20
cabinet with lock
H=52_3/4"
) - . . " : w=17_3/4" . Office Depot Bid
F f fil binet |Fireproof filing cabinet - 10
ireproof filing cabinet |Fireproof filing cabine D=25_1/16" Letter No bid uploaded 10/5/20
size file cab.
18X 24 Combination Office Depot Bid
tudent desk 18 x 24 desk 646 i
student des S desk Nobid uploaded 10/5/20
. . . . . Office Depot Bid
student chair 18 in. chair 18" 157
— 8" Chair No bid uploaded 10/5/20
120 "X48" cherry
conference table 120in x 48 in cherry confere conference table w/ 4 No bid Office Depot Bid
power data uploaded 10/5/20
grommet
School Outfitters $44.08 however;
this does not include shipping and
you will need to provide a tax
exemption form if tax is not charged.
31.5"H x 81.5"W x The order will need to be placed by Office Depot Bid
love seat 3 seat couch for lounge 2 Monday at noon however; the
32"D 3 seat couch ) ) N uploaded 10/5/20
shipment if the order is placed by
noon Monday is not due to arrive
until Oct. 12th. Assembly is not
included in this price. Quoted on a
black chair.
Desk Chair 42.91"H
24.02"
. . X 24.02"W x ) Office Depot Bid
conference chair high back leather 26.77"D47.00 32 No bid
uploaded 10/5/20
Ibs/$2,000.00
Assemblying Cost
Reception Chair Office Depot Bid
lounge room chair black leather reception chair[30.5"H x 33"W x 8 No bid
" uploaded 10/5/20
32.5"D
Deli D 10/12
Guest Chair 39" x Cymax Office Depot Denna Office Depot Bid E\:\r;);er:g\l/:;y Ts(tee e(rJTfaiIed a list of
waiting room chair guest chair, metal chrome  [23"W x 23"D 33.00 24 Business/86674098 |Wayfair 8449270361 R P v X .
White 5613000187 uploaded 10/5/20 vendors able to assemble. still waiting
Ibs $181.99 30/Mr. Kavesh ) .
for bid From Office Depot
Deli D 10/1. 10/1.
48 Wx20Dx24- Cymax E\:\r;);er:g\l/:;y T;:/ e%a:et:;ulisffnfg
. . 34 H in Height: 24 K . Office Depot Denna Office Depot Bid .
handicapped desk handicapped desk 11 B 2 1
pp t0 34 in Titanium usiness/86674098 |Wayfair 844927036 White 5613000187 uploaded 10/5/20 ver!dors ablgto aslslemble or\ce
K 30/Mr. Kavesh delivered. Still waiting for bid from
Laminate T-Mold X
Office Depot.
B Velocity B
unn Velocity Brew Cynax Delivery Date 10/12
BX 10 Cups Cymax . . .
X . X X Office Depot Denna Unassembled. They emailed a list of
coffee pots coffee maker Automatic Drip 3 Business/86674098 Wayfair 8449270361 ) . -
White 5613000187 vendors able to assemble. still waiting
Coffee Maker, Black 30/Mr. Kavesh A X
for bid From Office Depot
(38300.0067)
Frigidaire 18-cu ft Cymax ) Cynax Delivery Date 10/12 thru 10/16
. . . Office Depot Denna . .
refrigerator top freezer 18 cu. Ft. Top-Freezer 2 Business/86674098 |Wayfair 8449270361 White 5613000187 Unassembled. Waiting for bid from
Refrigerator (White) 30/Mr. Kavesh Office Depot
Item Office Depot Denna Williams Sonoma
Art flat file #852884Model 1 Target 225293-0984 | Walmart 2259529022 R P Waiting for bid from Office Depot
White 5613000187 |2257570016
#FFTR1814TW
SystemBuild Boss 2 Office Depot Denna
Library 2 library cabinets for storage|Door Base Cabinet, 2 Lowes $648.00 Home Depot $829.00 P Walmart 739.20.

Charcoal Gray

White 5613000187



mailto:Cymax%20(Kaveesh.K@cymax.com)866-740-9830%20%20NO%20bid
mailto:Cymax%20(Kaveesh.K@cymax.com)866-740-9830%20%20NO%20bid
mailto:School%20Specialty,%20$230.71%20each.%20All%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20Quote%20given%20by%20eric@cleanitsupply.com.%20Eric%20%20advised%20that%20all%20of%20these%20are%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20(484-685-5407)
mailto:School%20Specialty,%20$230.71%20each.%20All%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20Quote%20given%20by%20eric@cleanitsupply.com.%20Eric%20%20advised%20that%20all%20of%20these%20are%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20(484-685-5407)
mailto:School%20Specialty,%20$230.71%20each.%20All%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20Quote%20given%20by%20eric@cleanitsupply.com.%20Eric%20%20advised%20that%20all%20of%20these%20are%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20(484-685-5407)
mailto:School%20Specialty,%20$230.71%20each.%20All%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20Quote%20given%20by%20eric@cleanitsupply.com.%20Eric%20%20advised%20that%20all%20of%20these%20are%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20(484-685-5407)
mailto:School%20Specialty,%20$230.71%20each.%20All%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20Quote%20given%20by%20eric@cleanitsupply.com.%20Eric%20%20advised%20that%20all%20of%20these%20are%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20(484-685-5407)
mailto:School%20Specialty,%20$230.71%20each.%20All%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20Quote%20given%20by%20eric@cleanitsupply.com.%20Eric%20%20advised%20that%20all%20of%20these%20are%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20(484-685-5407)
mailto:School%20Specialty,%20$230.71%20each.%20All%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20Quote%20given%20by%20eric@cleanitsupply.com.%20Eric%20%20advised%20that%20all%20of%20these%20are%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20(484-685-5407)
mailto:School%20Specialty,%20$230.71%20each.%20All%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20Quote%20given%20by%20eric@cleanitsupply.com.%20Eric%20%20advised%20that%20all%20of%20these%20are%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20(484-685-5407)
mailto:School%20Specialty,%20$230.71%20each.%20All%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20Quote%20given%20by%20eric@cleanitsupply.com.%20Eric%20%20advised%20that%20all%20of%20these%20are%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20(484-685-5407)
mailto:School%20Specialty,%20$230.71%20each.%20All%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20Quote%20given%20by%20eric@cleanitsupply.com.%20Eric%20%20advised%20that%20all%20of%20these%20are%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20(484-685-5407)
mailto:School%20Specialty,%20$230.71%20each.%20All%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20Quote%20given%20by%20eric@cleanitsupply.com.%20Eric%20%20advised%20that%20all%20of%20these%20are%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20(484-685-5407)
https://www.cymax.com/Global-4-Drawer-Letter-Size-Vertical-Locking-Metal-File-Cabinet-in-Desert-Putty-25-401-DPT.htm
https://www.safetyfile.com/collections/fireking-vertical-25-depth-1-hour/products/4-1825-c
https://www.schoolspecialty.com/ProductDisplay?top_category5=&top_category4=&top_category3=&urlRequestType=Base&productId=3074457345616748140&catalogId=10101&top_category2=&categoryId=&errorViewName=ProductDisplayErrorView&urlLangId=-1&langId=-1&top_category=&parent_category_rn=&storeId=10801
https://www.schoolspecialty.com/ProductDisplay?top_category5=%5BLjava.lang.String%3B%401f3a3177&top_category4=%5BLjava.lang.String%3B%4011980249&top_category3=%5BLjava.lang.String%3B%4047fd5072&urlRequestType=Base&productId=3074457345616777754&catalogId=10101&top_category2=%5BLjava.lang.String%3B%407e622520&categoryId=&errorViewName=ProductDisplayErrorView&urlLangId=-1&langId=-1&top_category=&parent_category_rn=&storeId=10801
https://www.cymax.com/Prestige-120-in-x-48-in-Conference-Table-with-Power-Data-Grommet-Cherry-TVCTRC12048CH.htm
https://www.cymax.com/Allora-Caressoft-Plus-Bonded-Leather-Sofa-with-Chrome-Frame-in-Black-A-5145-198772.htm
https://www.cymax.com/Bush-Business-Furniture-High-Back-Executive-Office-Chair-for-Conference-Tables-CTB002LB.htm
https://www.cymax.com/Flash-Furniture-Black-Leather-Chair-ZB-8803-1-CHAIR-BK-GG.htm
https://www.cymax.com/Boss-Executive-CaressoftPlus-Guest-Chair-with-Metal-Chrome-Finish-B9479-GY.htm
https://www.schoolspecialty.com/cs-pedestal-2-student-desk-48x20-t-mold-5002561
https://www.staples.com/Bunn-10-Cup-Coffee-Brewer-with-Decanter-Black-Stainless-Steel/product_459111
https://www.lowes.com/pd/Frigidaire-18-cu-ft-Top-Freezer-Refrigerator-White/1000225701
https://www.amazon.com/dp/B01HJWDX1E/ref=twister_B082VYZNLN?_encoding=UTF8&psc=1

FURNITURE-BIG ITEMS: Quotes must be emailed to cclevenger@dcmcpartners.com by October 7th 12:00 PM CST

_ . School Speciali . Lake Charles 5
Item Item Description Item Specs Item Quantity Vender 1 Vendor 2 Vendor 3 Vendor 4 Amazon p ty School Outfitters Office Depot GBP Direct Comments
multi items Offices Supply
Engineers Supply
Co./Safco 5 Drawer
Steel Flat File for
. . N Paragon Infinity™ School Outfitters Office Depot Denna [30" x 42" . . )
Librar 20 shelving units river cherr 20 Sweetwater 8002224700 Waiting for bid from Office Depot
Y = “Mobile Shelving $642.99 White 5613000187 |Documents ¢ P
4996BLR (Black)
$1200.99(80059189
07
. Modern Office Office Depot Denna - . X
Libran Help Desk 1 Waiting for bid from Office Depot
v nepoesx 8004435117 White 5613000187 & P
Mary Villaume
i i ice D D
Library 2 Mobile Folding Teacher De| would like this 3 Demco 8003561200 |Lowes 2259287200 Ofﬂ,w epot Denna | Walmart Waiting for bid from Office Depot
teacher desk, White 5613000187 (2257667776
please.
ice D D
ID machine http://southernvisuals.com/ p%SOOs Color card 1 Ofﬂ,w epot Denna Waiting for bid from Office Depot
Printer White 5613000187
i Di ice D D
ID Machine ID Cardmaker V6.5 Software|SD897002 1 Worthington Direct Wayfair/8449270361 Ofﬂ,w epot Denna Waiting for bid from Office Depot
8005996636 White 5613000187
ID machine 30MIL Portrait white cards |CR8030PP 1 Southern Visuals AlphaCard 8007178080 Ofﬂ,w Depot Denna Waiting for bid from Office Depot
8772342792 White 5613000187
idE D' ice D D
ID machine YMCK-T 250 Image Ribbon |3-0104-1 1 PolaroidEnable ID's All Business Security 8333991700 Ofﬂ,w epot Denna Waiting for bid from Office Depot
.com 5129183487 White 5613000187
Swingline® High
Capacity Heavy X
. _— Alpha Cards . Office Depot Denna |Alpha Cards . . )
office Heavy Duty Swingline Staple|Duty Stapler, 210 1 Gotprint. 8779227374 Waiting for bid from Office Depot
AU g Be| duty Stapler, 8889320612 otprint.com White 5613000187 |8889320612 ¢ P
Sheet Capacity,
Black (90002)
Vita Vibe - Prodigy
Series Portable
Double Aluminum
dance ballet bars Freestanding Ballet 10 Digi Card BEC Plastic Card Solutions OﬁlFe Depot Denna Waiting for bid from Office Depot
Barre, 8669165100 8043302500 White 5613000187
Stretch/Dance Bar -
USA Made -4 FT-8
FT
ice D D
choir Yamaha Keyboard and AC A Yamaha keyboard 1 Staples 8003333330 Ofﬂ,w epot Denna Gibson 8002755999 Waiting for bid from Office Depot
and AC adapter White 5613000187
Blackstar Jared
i 20 - i i ice D D
Band Guitar Amps James Slgnatlﬂre 0 5 Vita Vibe Custom Barre Store8887729479 Ofﬂ,ce epot Denna Waiting for bid from Office Depot
20-watt 1x12" Tube Inc.8642888934 White 5613000187
Combo Amp
Magna Visual®
Porcelain Dry Erase On Stage Office Depot Denna |Guitar Center
counselin scheduling board Board w/Horizontal 1 BH 8778777158 Waiting for bid from Office Depot
¢ Aoar w/ OI'I.ZOH ? 8556970864 White 5613000187 |8556970864 € P
Lines & Planning Kit,
36"W x 24"H
- ice D D Bindi
ZZOUNDS 800 Sweetwater 8002224700 Off|Fe epot Denna | MyBinding Waiting for bid from Office Depot
996-8637 White 5613000187 |8009444573
Office World Office Depot D X
ce Wor Quaret 8447153694 ce Depot Denna Waiting for bid from Office Depot

8778168767

White 5613000187



mailto:Cymax%20(Kaveesh.K@cymax.com)866-740-9830%20%20NO%20bid
mailto:Cymax%20(Kaveesh.K@cymax.com)866-740-9830%20%20NO%20bid
mailto:School%20Specialty,%20$230.71%20each.%20All%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20Quote%20given%20by%20eric@cleanitsupply.com.%20Eric%20%20advised%20that%20all%20of%20these%20are%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20(484-685-5407)
mailto:School%20Specialty,%20$230.71%20each.%20All%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20Quote%20given%20by%20eric@cleanitsupply.com.%20Eric%20%20advised%20that%20all%20of%20these%20are%20in%20stock%20at%20the%20moment.%20(484-685-5407)
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https://www.demco.com/paragon-infinity-trade-mobile-shelving
https://www.amazon.com/Stand-Up-Desk-Store-Adjustable/dp/B01MT1HFF2?ref_=ast_sto_dp
https://www.amazon.com/Tangkula-Foldable-Computer-Portable-Apartment/dp/B07MBDSTDY/ref=sr_1_69?dchild=1&keywords=mobile+desk&qid=1601434708&sr=8-69
http://southernvisuals.com/polaroid/index.htm
https://www.staples.com/Swingline-High-Capacity-Heavy-Duty-Full-Strip-Stapler-210-Sheet-Capacity-Black/product_504506
https://www.amazon.com/Vita-Vibe-BD96-Portable-Freestanding/dp/B003FBU6GE/ref=sr_1_15?dchild=1&keywords=Ballet+Barres&qid=1601493611&sr=8-15
https://www.magnatag.com/cart?utm_source=Magnatag&utm_medium=social&utm_campaign=Shared%20Cart&utm_content=%2Fcart&_loadCart=5f749a6168b33343bd964b09

TECHNOLOGY: Quotes must be emailed to cclevenger@dcmcpartners.com by October 7th 12:00 PM CST

Item Item Description Item Specs Item Quantity CDW COMMENTS
Computer/with docking station Dell Laptop and docking station 16GB BAM’ _ZS_GGB PCle SSD, Intel UHD 22
Graphics, WiFi, Bluetooth
Keyboard . . . . Wireless 22
Mouse Combo (LG 24M47VQ 24-inch monitor & 6 feet HDMI cable & Logitech MK270 Wireless Keyboard and Wireless >
Mouse)
HDMI Cable 6 Feet 22
Intel NUC NUC1017FNH Home and
Business Desktop Black (Intel i7-10710U
. 6-Core, 16GB RAM, 256GB PCle SSD,
NUC NUC (computer, Keyboard, mouse) Intel NUC NUC1017FNH Home and Business Desktop Black Intel UHD Graphics, WiFi, Bluetooth, 22
1xHDMI, SD Card, Win 10 Pro) with USB
Hub
USB Hub 4 port USB 3.0 Hub 22
32" Monitors 32" Monitors- LED Black 4
Monitors 27" Monitor LED Curved, Viotek NBV27CB 27 inch LED Monitor Black 27
HP Color LaserJet Pro M454dw Wireless
Color Printer Color Laser Printer La.ser. Printer, I?ouble—5|ded & MObII? 3
Printing, Security Features, Works with
Alexa (W1Y45A)
Printers Momochrome Laser Printer Wirless Laser with Double sided printing 13
3 Printer with Fax capibilties 3
Classroom Projector Screens - Buhl
Classroom Projector Screens 80x80 White Matte Manual Wall Square Format PI’Oj.eCtOI' 15
Screen - 80"H x 80"W Matte White
Fabric®
Large Group projector & screen 120 inch Out door Projector SHCI;e:S with a Stand 16:9, 8K 4K Ultra 1
Vankyo Leisure 3 Mini Projector, Vankyo Leis.ure 3 Mini Projector, 1080P 1
and 170" Display Supported
Projector EpsTJn Powerlite 98H XGA 3LCD 10
Projector
Projector LiteShowInFocus LiteShow 4 DB+ Dual B 10
External Back-up Drives 5
- SonicWall NSA 3600 Total - Advanced
Sonic Firewall " 1
Edition 1 Year Bundle
Seagate Expansion Desktop 16TB
Expansion Desktop External Hard Drive For PC or Laptom External Hard Drive HDD - USB 3.0 for 5
PC Laptop (STEB16000402)
Servers PowerEdge T440 Tower Server 1
COMPONENTS
Option Selection SKU / Product Code Quantity
Base PowerEdge T440 Server [210-AMEI] 1
Trusted Platform Module (TPM) No Trusted Platform Module [461-AADZ] / NTPM 1
Chassis Chassis with up to 8, 3.5" Hot Plug Hard Drives, Tower Configuration [321-BCVN] / 5105128 1
Regulatory PowerEdge T440 CCC and BIS Marking, No CE Marking [389-DSXM] / G21XDO03 1
Processor Intel® Xeon® Gold 5222 3.8G, 4C/8T, 10.4GT/s, 16.5M Cache, Turbo, HT (105W) DDR4-2933 [338-BSGI] / G8Q4BSP 1
Additional Processor No Additional Processor [374-BBBX] / 1P 1
Processor Thermal Configuration 1 CPU standard [412-AAJW] / 5104987 1




TECHNOLOGY: Quotes must be emailed to cclevenger@dcmcpartners.com by October 7th 12:00 PM CST

Item Item Description Item Specs Item Quantity CDW COMMENTS

Memory DIMM Type and Speed 2666MT/s RDIMMs [370-ADNU] / 5099278 1
Memory Configuration Type Performance Optimized [370-AAIP] / PEOPT 1
Memoryi 32GB RDIMM, 2666MT/s, Dual Rank [370-ADNF] / 5098890 1
RAID C7, Unconfigured RAID for HDDs or SSDs (Mixed Drive Types Allowed) [780-BCDS] / 5098876 1
RAID/Internal Storage Controllers PERC H330 RAID Controller [405-AANS] / 5102569 1
Hard Drive 480GB SSD SATA Mix Use 6Gbps 512 2.5in Hot-plug AG Drive,3.5in HYB CARR, 3 DWPD, 2628 TBW [400-AZVL] / GABDSK1 1
Hard Drive 960GB SSD SAS Read Intensive 12Gbps 512 2.5in Hot-plug AG Drive,3.5in HYB CARR, 1 DWPD, 1752 TBW [[400-AXYH] / GA25CDY 1
Hard Drive 1.8TB 10K RPM SAS 12Gbps 512e 2.5in Hot-plug Hard Drive, 3.5in HYB CARR [400-ASMQ] / 5107806 1
Boot Optimized Storage Cards None

Operating System No Operating System [619-ABVR] / NOOS 1
0OS Media Kits No Media Required [421-5736] / NOMED 1
Embedded Systems Management iDrac9, Basic [385-BBLD] / 5103856 1
Group Manager iDRAC Group Manager, Disabled [379-BCQY] / 5100926 1
Password iDRAC,Factory Generated Password [379-BCSF] / 5101343 1
iDRAC Service Module iDRAC Service Module (ISM), NOT Installed [379-BCQX] / 5102434 1
Additional Network Cards On-Board Broadcom 5720 Dual Port 1Gb LOM [542-BBBP] / OBNIC 1
Internal Optical Drive No Internal Optical Drive [429-AAIQ][429-AAQS] / NODVD 1
Fans None

Power Supply Single, Cabled Power Supply 450W [450-AGQW] / 5106248 1
Power Cords NEMA 5-15P to C13 Wall Plug, 125 Volt, 15 AMP, 10 Feet (3m), Power Cord, North America [450-AALV] / 125V10 1
Bezel No Bezel [325-BCON][350-BBBW] / NOBEZL 1
BIOS and Advanced System Configuration Settings|Performance BIOS Setting [384-BBBL] / HPBIOS 1
Advanced System Configurations UEFI BIOS Boot Mode with GPT Partition [800-BBDM] / UEFIB 1
Rack Rails No Rack Rails, No Cable Management Arm, No Casters [770-BBCR] / NRCMCS 1
System Documentation No Systems Documentation, No OpenManage DVD Kit [631-AACK] / NODOCS 1

Technical Support (Formatting and Networking
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